


Bid No.  5555-2019 
Description:  Recycling/Disposal of Obsolete Electronic Equipment 
Department:  Property Management 
Opening Date:  January 24, 2019 @ 2:00 P.M. 

Item Description A1 Assets Inc. 
AERC Acquisition 

Corporation 
Coretek  

Enterprises LLC 

Green Wave 
Computer Recycling 

LLC 

A. Pricing 

1. Computers, various models +$7.00 each +$24.00 each No Bid +.16₡ lb. / +$3.00 each 

2. Monitors, flat panels - various models +$3.00 each +$1.45 each No Bid +$1.25 each 

3. Computer switches 0.00 +$8.00 each No Bid +.16₡ lb. / +$3.00 each 

4. Servers 0.00 +$24.00 each No Bid +.25₡ lb. / +$6.00 each 

5. Laptops +$12.00 each +$35.00 each No Bid +.50₡ lb. / +$7.00 each 

6. Telecommunication Devices 0.00 -.20₡ lb. No Bid 0.00 

7. Large Peripherals (printers, scanners, etc.) 0.00 -.20₡ lb. No Bid 0.00 

8. Small Peripherals (keyboards, mice, etc.) 0.00 -.20₡ lb. No Bid 0.00 

9. Audio / Video equipment 0.00 -.20₡ lb. No Bid 0.00 

10. UPS 0.00 -.20₡ lb. No Bid +0.05₡ lb. 

11. Copiers 0.00 -.20₡ lb. No Bid 0.00 

12. Miscellaneous Electronics 0.00 -.20₡ lb. No Bid 0.00 

B. Cost of removal/disposal 

1. Monitors, CRT -.22₡ lb. -.50₡ lb. No Bid 0.00 

2. Televisions <20” diag, CRT -.22₡ lb. -.50₡ lb. No Bid 0.00 

3. Televisions ≥20” diag, CRT -.22₡ lb. -.50₡ lb. No Bid 0.00 

Bidders are hereby notified that failure to file a protest within the time prescribed in section 120.57(3) Florida Statutes and Board Policy 6320.02, or failure to post the 
bond or other security required by law within the time allowed for filing a bond shall constitute a waiver of proceedings.  Offers received from the vendor listed herein 
are the only offers received timely as of the above opening date and time.  All other offers submitted in response to this solicitation, if any, are hereby rejected as late. 

    

Opened By: Nancy Scott   Date: January 24, 2019 

      
      

Recorded By: Taneka Forbes   Date: January 24, 2019 

 


