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MEMORANDUM I

To: June Kail, Director of Purchasing ¢

From: Dr. Michael Moore, Director of Transportation

Date: April 14 2017

Subject: Recommendation Letter for Bid No. 5451-2018 Compressed Natural Gas (CNG) & Diesel Engines

This memo is to provide my recommendations on Bid No. 5451-2018 Compressed Natural Gas (CNG) & Diesel
Engines. | recommend awarding the bid below to the vendors cited on the page attached. Each vendor has
been recommended based on price per engine. The recommendations here | believe to be in the district’s best
interest.

If you have any questions or concerns, please feel free to contact me.
GP/sp

Cc: Gerona Pye, Vehicle Maintenance Manager
Amos Long, District Services Specialist

ENGINE TYPE ENGINE MANUFACTURER VENDOR
DT-360 NAVISTAR WARD
DT-408 NAVISTAR JASPER
DTA-466 NAVISTAR WARD
ISC8.3 CUMMINS JASPER
3126E CATERPILLAR WARD
DTA 466E NAVISTAR JASPER
DT444E NAVISTAR WARD
MBES00 DETROIT DIESEL WARD
CNG ISL-G 280350HP CUMMINS MATTHEWS
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LCS Bid No. 5451-2018
Description: COMPRESSED NATURAL GAS (CNG) & DIESEL ENGINES
Department: TRANSPORTATION

Opening Date: APRIL 11, 2017 @ 2:00 P.M.

Item # Engine Model/Make WARD
CUMMINS SALES & | JASPER ENGINES & | MATTHEWS BUSES INTERNATIONAL
Price Per Unit SERVICE TRANSMISSIONS FLORIDA TRUCKS OF
FLORIDA, LLC
1 DT-360 / Navistar Price NO BID $ 8,162.00 NO BID $ 7,689.27
Core S 1,800.00 S 2,500.00
i N 4 NO BID NO BID
’ DT-408 / Navistar Price O BID S 9,222.00 o]
Core S 3,500.00
7 2 . 208,
3 DTA-466 f Navistar Price NO BID S 9,626.00 | § 8,621.92 | S 8,208.00
Core S 3,000.00 | & 3,000.00 | $ 3,000.00
$14,651.00/
. . Price S 18,120.00 |$15,478.00 S 17,654.00 NO BID
4 ISC 8.3 / Cummins Diesel 33,000.00/
Core |S 4,500.00 |$4,000.00 $ 4,500.00
5 3126E \ ﬁmﬁm_.ﬁ:_m_‘ Price NO BID S 13,762.00 | S 13,257.32 | S 12,621.00
Core S 2,500.00 | § 3,000.00 | S 3,000.00
$13,904.12/
6 DTA-466E / Navistar Price NO BID S 11,368.00 |$15,904.12 S 13,199.00
Core S 3,000.00 | $ 3,200.00 | S 3,200.00
7 DT-444E / Navistar Price NO BID S 8,511.00 | § 6,952.10 | S 6,619.00
Core S 1,200.00 | $ 2,000.00 | § 2,000.00
; i BID 438.50 3
3 MBE-900 / Detroit Diesel Price NO NO BID S 16, S 15,599.00
Core ) 5,000.00 | S 5,000.00
9 ﬁzm-_m_.-m-mworwwOI_u\ Price S 37,525.00 NO BID S 28,162.15 NO BID
BumpminsCG Core | Return Dataplate $ 4,500.00
Opened By: June Kail Date: April 11, 2017 Opened By: Olivia Willis Date:

April 11, 2017




