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40 BINDER, 3 RING NOTEBOOK, 8.5" X 11", 1" CAP., VINYL 1152 each 40
BLACK $0.92 $1.24 $0.93 $1.55 $1.24 $1.08
45 BINDERS, 3-RING NOTEBOOK, 8.5" X 11", VINYL, OVER 0 each 45
HARDBACK, RING SIZE 3" CAP., COLOR: BLACK $2.63 $3.95 $2.69 $5.99 $2.08
60 BRUSHES, FLAT CHISEL, SIZE: 1/4", SQUARE EDGE, 144 each 60
CRAYOLA OR GRUMBACHER $0.35 $0.15 $0.64 $0.09
70 BRUSHES, FLAT CHISEL, SIZE: 1/2", SQUARE EDGE, 144 each 70
CRAYOLA OR GRUMBACHER $0.48 $0.22 $0.85 $0.16
75 BRUSHES, FLAT CHISEL, SIZE: 3/4", SQUARE EDGE, 72 each 75
CRAYOLA OR GRUMBACHER $0.64 $0.27 $1.06 $0.21
80 BRUSHES, FLAT CHISEL, SIZE: 1", SQUARE EDGE, 72 each 80
CRAYOLA OR GRUMBACHER $0.75 $0.39 $1.39 $0.30
160 |BRUSHES, ROUND POINT, #5, CRAYOLA OR 60 each 160
GRUMBACHER $0.38 $0.21 $0.38 $0.08
165 |BRUSHES, ROUND POINT, #7, CRAYOLA OR 60 each 165
GRUMBACHER $0.42 $0.24 $0.42 $0.10
175 |BRUSHES, ROUND POINT, #10, CRAYOLA OR 48 each 175
GRUMBACHER $0.52 $0.29 $0.46 $0.12
180 |BRUSHES, ROUND POINT, #12, CRAYOLA OR 84 each 180
GRUMBACHER $0.66 $0.35 $0.49 $0.15
185 |BRUSHES, ROUND POINT, #8, CRAYOLA OR 60 each 185
GRUMBACHER S0.44 $0.25 $0.44 $0.10
215 BRUSHES, WATER COLOR, #3, FINE POINT, CRAYOLA 60 each 215
OR GRUMBACHER $0.52 $0.35 $0.36

Page 1 of 28




LCS Bid #5354-2016

School Supplies for the District Warehouse o3 E E o
Bid Opening: January 28, 2015 @ 2:00 p.m. _ E\ e E g = Q
- S| <2 w % = S
Awarded by Item o ® = 2 _ a a g x Z .
o ) < 0O o o (@) (TS
Awarded by Group 2 @ 2 3 S & _ 3 < S = < g
Florida Preference (per FS 287.084) o = “w 2 = 2 -3 = e Z E ) s g
No Bid 2 | B8 | 23| x| 3 2 55| & | &8
220 |BRUSHES, WATER COLOR, #5, FINE POINT, CRAYOLA 12 each 220
OR GRUMBACHER $0.58 $0.39
235 |BRUSHES, WATER COLOR, #8, FINE POINT, CRAYOLA 48 each 235
OR GRUMBACHER $0.74 $0.45 $0.48
350 |CARDS, INDEX 3" X 5", WHITE, 1/4" RULED, ONE SIDE, 288 pkg 350
90 LB WEIGHT, 100 PER PACKAGE $0.27 $0.29 $0.25 $0.34 $0.34
360 |CARDS, INDEX, 4" X 6", WHITE, 1/2" RULED, ONE SIDE, 144 pkg 360
90 LB WEIGHT, 100 PER PACKAGE $0.50 $0.49 $0.61 $0.55 $0.61
370  |CARDS, INDEX, 5" X 8", WHITE, 1/4" RULED, ONE SIDE, 0 box 370
90 LB WEIGHT, 500 PER BOX $0.86 $0.82 $0.83 $0.92 $1.05
410 |CEMENT, RUBBER, 4 OZ., METAL CONTAINER, BRUSH 576 bottle 410
IN CAP, ROSS NO. 44 $1.07 $0.90 $1.23 $1.27 $1.04
460 |CHALK, DUSTLESS, ASSORTED, 12 COLORS PER BOX, 48 box 460
STICKS 2 3/4" X 7/16", WEBER COSTELLO $0.65 $0.29 $1.03 $0.25
480 |CHALK, SOFT SQUARE PASTELS, REGULAR SIZE, 2 3/4" X 48 box 480
7/16", 12 COLORS PER BOX, WEBER COSTELLO, #10057
$3.47 $3.85 $3.96 $2.49 $2.77
490 |CHALK, PASTEL OIL, WATER SOLUBLE, 12 COLORS PER 144 box 490
BOX, CRAYOLA PORTFOLIO SERIES $2.72 $2.26 $2.28
540 |CLAY, WHITE, AMACO, #25, 25 POUND BAGS 100 bags 540 $44.00 $15.99 | $7.37
550 |CLAY, MODELING, NON-HARDENING, NON-TOXIC, NON{ 300 box 550
STAINING, 1/4" LB., STICK, 4 STICKS PER BOX, COLORS:
BLUE, GREEN, RED, YELLOW ,KLEAN KLAY / NO
ALTERNATES $2.05 $0.95 $0.77
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560 CLIPBOARD, LEGAL SIZE, HEAVY DUTY, PRESSED 0 each 560
BOARD, 9" X 15 1/2", IDL $0.74 $1.18 $0.68 $1.59 $0.83
565 CLIPBOARD, LETTER SIZE, 8 3/4" X 12", HEAVY DUTY, 576 each 565
PRESSED BOARD, IDL S0.71 $0.95 $0.59 $1.43 $0.75 $0.59
660 CRAYONS, 8 COUNT, REGULAR SIZE, ASSORTED 576 box 660
COLORS, CRAYOLA NO. 8, #52-0008-1-100, BINNEY
AND SMITH / NO ALTERNATES $0.39 $0.23 $0.49 $0.24 $0.39
670 CRAYONS, 16 COUNT, REGULAR SIZE, NO. 16, 2400 box 670
ASSORTED COLORS, #52-0016-1-100, BINNEY AND
SMITH / NO ALTERNATES $0.82 $0.38 $0.94 $0.39 $0.78
671 CRAYONS, FOR CONSTRUCTION PAPER, 16 COUNT, 144 box 671
REGULAR SIZE, ASSORTED, BINNEY AND SMITH / NO
ALTERNATES $1.58 $1.28 $3.19 $1.60
680 CRAYONS, 24 COUNT, REGULAR SIZE, ASSORTED 2400 box 680
COLORS, NO. 24, #52-0024-1-000, BINNEY AND SMITH
/ NO ALTERNATES $1.08 $0.65 $1.19 $0.72 $1.06
690 CRAYONS, 48 COUNT, REGULAR SIZE, ASSORTED 0 box 690
COLORS, #52-0048-1-100, BINNEY & SMITH / NO
ALTERNATES $1.55 $1.56 $2.11
700 CRAYONS, 8 COUNT, LARGE, NO-ROLL, ASSORTED 0 box 700
COLORS, #52-080B, BINNEY AND SMITH / NO
ALTERNATES $0.87 $2.39 $0.88
710 CRAYONS, 8 COUNT, LARGE SIZE, ASSORTED COLORS, 300 box 710
#52-0080-1-000, BINNEY AND SMITH / NO
ALTERNATES $1.12 $0.62 S1.16 $0.63 $1.10
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711 CRAYONS, MULTICULTURAL, 8 COUNT, REGULAR, 300 box 711
BINNEY AND SMITH / NO ALTERNATES $0.52 $0.32 $0.49 $0.33 $0.48
712 CRAYONS, MULTICULTURAL, 8 COUNT, LARGE, BINNEY 300 box 712
AND SMITH / NO ALTERNATES $1.30 $0.64 $0.64 $1.12
720 CRAYONS, 16 COUNT, LARGE, ROUND, ASSORTED 300 box 720
COLORS, #52-0160-1-000, BINNEY AND SMITH / NO
ALTERNATES $2.36 $1.50 $3.23 $1.50
745 ENVELOPES, COIN, 3" X 4 7/8", 500 PER BOX 0 box 745 $11.80 $25.00
800 ENVELOPES, KRAFT, 10" X 13", INTER-DEPARTMENT 0 box 800
MAIL, SUB 32, 100 PER BOX $9.59 $16.90 $12.71 $12.77 $13.00
820 ENVELOPES, LEGAL SIZE, PLAIN, WHITE, WOVE, #10, 4 100 box 820
1/8" X 9 1/2", 500 PER BOX, SUB-GUMMED $6.90 $9.22 $6.86 $6.19 $7.94 $6.84 $6.50
830 |ENVELOPES, LETTER SIZE, WHITE, 3 5/8" X 6 1/2", 500 50 box 830
PER BOX, SUB-GUMMED $6.39 $8.54 $6.35 $11.19 $7.07 $6.35
850 ENVELOPES, CLASP, 6 1/2" X9 1/2", SUB 28, SUB- 100 box 850
GUMMED, KRAFT, 100 PER BOX $5.31 $7.09 $5.27 $14.39 $5.75 $5.26 $5.00
860 |ENVELOPES, CLASP, 9" X 12", SUB 28, 100 PER BOX, 75 box 860
SUB-GUMMED $5.73 | $7.65 $5.69 | ¢5.41 $6.77 $5.68 $5.35
880 ENVELOPES, CLASP, 10" X 13", SUB 28, KRAFT, 100 PER 100 box 880
BOX, SUB-GUMMED $6.65 $8.89 $6.61 $6.44 $8.22 $6.60 $6.35
890 ENVELOPES, CLASP, 10" X 15", SUB 28, 100 PER BOX, 0 box 890
SUB-GUMMED $9.17 $12.25 $9.11 $26.39 $8.27 $9.80
900 ERASER, ART GUM, 2" X 1" X 1", 12 PER BOX, 100 box 900
PAPERMATE / NO ALTERNATES $5.04 $5.62
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910 |ERASER, CHALKBOARD, 1 1/2" X 5", FELT, DOUBLE 288 each 910
SEWED $0.56 $1.29 $0.43 | S$1.19* $0.43 $0.39
920 |ERASER, PENCIL CAPON, 144 PER BOX, PINK PEARL, 288 box 920
PAPERMATE / NO ALTERNATES $3.58 $3.43 $3.45 $8.87 $3.94 $3.38
940 |ERASER, PINK PEARL, 12 PER BOX, 2 3/8" X 7/8" X 204 box 940
13/16", PAPERMATE / NO ALTERNATES $4.30 $3.96 $4.95 $4.52 $3.88
970  |FASTENERS, SIZE: GEM #1, 1000 PER CARTON, NON- 0 carton 970
RUST $1.70 $1.70
980 |FASTENERS, SIZE: GEM #3, 1000 PER CARTON, NON- 288 carton 980
RUST $2.49 $2.41
990 |FASTENERS, GEM, JUMBO SIZE, 100 PER BOX, SMOOTH| 500 box 990
FINISH, NON-RUST $0.42 $0.45 $0.43
1010 |FASTENERS, PAPER, 3/4" BRASS SHARP POINT, 100 PER| 288 box 1010
BOX, DOUBLE SPREADING SHANK $0.52 $0.56 $0.53 $0.50
1090 |FIXATIVE SPRAY, CLEAR PLASTIC, 16 OZ. CAN, KRYLON 6 can 1090
#1306 $8.95 $3.79 $3.89
1105 |LIQUID PAPER, 1/2 OZ., WHITE, FLUID CORRECTION, 1200 bottle 1105
#564-01, 12 BOTTLES PER CARTON, PLASTIC
CONTAINER $0.78 $0.37 $14.31 $0.92 $0.36
1120 |FOLDERS, FILE, LETTER SIZE, HEAVY DUTY, 11 PT. 1/3 600 box 1120
CUT, 100 PER BOX, 9 1/2 " X 11 3/4", MANILLA $4.60 $4.58 $4.63 $3.50 $5.41 $5.78
1130 |FOLDERS, FILE, LEGAL SIZE, HEAVY DUTY, 11 PT. 1/3 0 box 1130
CUT, 100 PER BOX, 9 1/2" X 15", MANILLA $6.42 $6.11 $6.46 $11.19 $7.43
1140 |FOLDERS, FILE POCKET, LEGAL SIZE, EXPANDABLE TO 3 600 each 1140
1/2", VERTICAL, #1524E SCM $0.39 $0.44 $1.54 $0.62 $0.46
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1141 |FOLDERS, FILE POCKET, LETTER SIZE, EXPANDABLE TO 3] 600 each 1141
1/2", #1526 SCM $0.46 $0.50 $1.38 $0.70 $0.54
1150 |GLAZE, 16 OZ. JAR, NO LEAD, OPALESCENT, SAPPHIRE 24 bottle 1150
BLUE, AMACO $9.70 $8.79
1160 |GLAZE, LIQUID GLOSS, 16 OZ. JAR, NO LEAD, GLOSS, 0 bottle 1160
AMBER, AMACO $11.25 $10.56
1172 |GLAZE, LIQUID GLOSS, 16 OZ. JAR, NO LEAD, LEAF 0 bottle 1172
GREEN, AMACO $9.95 $9.07
1176 |GLAZE, 16 OZ. JAR, NO LEAD, OPALESCENT, AQUA 36 bottle 1176
MARINE, AMACO $9.70 $8.71
1180 |GLAZE, LIQUID GLOSS, 16 OZ. JAR, NO LEAD, AUTUMN 0 bottle 1180
LEAF, AMACO $9.70 $8.71
1205 |GLAZE, LIQUID GLOSS, MOTTLED BURGANDY, 16 OZ. 0 bottle 1205
JAR, NO LEAD, AMACO $9.70
1207 |GLAZE, TURQUOISE, 16 OZ. JAR, NO LEAD, 24 bottle 1207
OPALESCENT, AMACO $9.70 $8.71
1270 |GLAZE, LIQUID GLOSS, BLACK LUSTER, 16 OZ. JAR, NO 36 bottle 1270
LEAD, AMACO $10.25 $9.49
1290 |GLAZE, BLUE-BELL, OPALESCENT, 16 OZ. JAR, NO LEAD, 36 bottle 1290
AMACO $9.70 $8.71
1305 |GLAZE, LIQUID GLOSS, CANARY YELLOW, 16 OZ. JAR, 36 bottle 1305
NO LEAD, AMACO $10.95 $8.98
1320 |GLAZE, LIQUID GLOSS, MULBERRY RED, 10 0Z., NO 0 bottle 1320
LEAD, AMACO $11.25 $10.55
1350 |GLAZE, LIQUID GLOSS, TRANSPARENT CLEAR, 16 OZ., 36 bottle 1350
NO LEAD, AMACO $8.40 $7.24
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1385 |GLAZE, WHITE CLOVER, 16 OZ., NO LEAD, OPALESCENT, 24 bottle 1385
AMACO $9.70
1390 |GLITTER, BLUE, .5, 3/4 OZ. VIAL, METALLIC COLOR, 144 each 1390
SIFTER TOP $0.40 $0.65 $0.49 $0.77 $0.31
1400 |GLITTER, GOLD, .5, 3/4 OZ. VIAL, METALLIC COLOR, 144 each 1400
SIETER TOP $0.40 $0.65 $0.49 $0.77 $0.31
1410 |GLITTER, GREEN, .5, 3/4 OZ. VIAL, METALLIC COLOR, 0 each 1410
SIFTER TOP $0.40 $0.65 $0.49 $0.77 $0.31
1430 |GLITTER, RED, .5, 3/4 OZ. VIAL, METALLIC COLOR, 144 each 1430
SIETER TOP $0.40 $0.65 $0.49 $0.80 $0.31
1440 |GLITTER, SILVER, .5, 3/4 OZ. VIAL, METALLIC COLOR, 144 each 1440
SIFTER TOP $0.40 $0.65 $0.49 $0.77 $0.31
1450 |GLUE, MULTI-PURPOSE, 4 OZ., SQUEEZE BOTTLE, E372, 2400 bottle 1450
ELMERS / NO ALTERNATES $0.65 $2.47 $0.81 $0.64
1460 |GLUE, MULTI-PURPOSE, 8 OZ., SQUEEZE BOTTLE, E379, 576 bottle 1460
ELMERS / NO ALTERNATES $1.02 $3.43 $1.27 $1.01
1490 |GLUE, STICKS, 12 PER PACK, ELMERS / NO ALTERNATES 0 pack 1490
$2.10 $3.48
1650 |INK, STAMP PAD, BLACK, 2 OZ., BOTTLE, #58701, 36 bottle 1650
SANEORD $0.79 $1.99 $0.79
1660 |INK, STAMP PAD, RED, 2 OZ., BOTTLE, #58702, 24 bottle 1660
SANFORD $0.79 $1.83 $0.79
1670 ]INK, BLOCK PRINTING, BLACK, 2.5 OZ. TUBE, WATER 24 tube 1670
SOLUBLE, SPEEDBALL $3.89 $2.89 $2.66 $1.69
1680 |INK, BLOCK PRINTING, BLUE, 2.5 OZ. TUBE, WATER 12 tube 1680
SOLUBLE, SPEEDBALL $3.89 $2.89 $2.66 $1.69
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1690 |INK, BLOCK PRINTING, BROWN, 2.5 OZ. TUBE, WATER 0 tube 1690
SOLUBLE, SPEEDBALL $3.89 $2.89 $1.69
1700 |INK, BLOCK PRINTING, GREEN, 2.5 OZ. TUBE, WATER 12 tube 1700
SOLUBLE, SPEEDBALL $3.89 $2.89 $2.66 $1.69
1710 |INK, BLOCK PRINTING, MAGENTA, 2.5 OZ. TUBE, 12 tube 1710
WATER SOLUBLE, SPEEDBALL $3.89 $2.89 $2.66 $1.69
1720 |INK, BLOCK PRINTING, ORANGE, 2.5 OZ. TUBE, WATER 0 tube 1720
SOLUBLE, SPEEDBALL $3.89 $2.89 $2.66 $1.69
1730 |INK, BLOCK PRINTING, RED, 2.5 OZ. TUBE, WATER 12 tube 1730
SOLUBLE, SPEEDBALL $3.89 $2.89 $2.66 $1.69
1740 |INK, BLOCK PRINTING, TURQUOISE, 2.5 OZ. TUBE, 12 tube 1740
WATER SOLUBLE, SPEEDBALL $3.89 $2.89 $2.66 $1.69
1750 |INK, BLOCK PRINTING, YELLOW, 2.5 OZ. TUBE, WATER 6 tube 1750
SOLUBLE, SPEEDBALL $3.89 $2.89 $2.66 $1.69
1760 |INK, BLOCK PRINTING, WHITE, 2.5 OZ. TUBE, WATER 12 tube 1760
SOLUBLE, SPEEDBALL $3.89 $2.89 $2.66 $1.69
1890 |MARKERS, PERMANENT, FELT TIP, 3 WAY, LEAK PROOF,| 288 each 1890
12 PER BOX, BLACK, ODORLESS, SANFORD POWER
MARK NO ALTERNATES $0.12 $0.11
1900 |MARKERS, PERMANENT, FELT TIP, 3 WAY, LEAK PROOF,| 288 each 1900
12 PER BOX, BLUE, ODORLESS, SANFORD POWER
MARK NO ALTERNATES $0.12 $0.11
1910 |MARKERS, PERMANENT, FELT TIP, 3 WAY, LEAK PROOF,| 288 each 1910
12 PER BOX, BROWN, ODORLESS, SANFORD POWER
MARK NO ALTERNATES $0.12 $0.11
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1920

MARKERS, PERMANENT, FELT TIP, 3 WAY, LEAK PROOF,
12 PER BOX, GREEN, ODORLESS, SANFORD POWER
MARK NO ALTERNATES

144

each

1920

AFP

Hollywood, FI

DGS

Delray Beach, FI

NATIONAL ART &
SCHOOL SUPPLY

PYRAMID
Tampa, Fl

QUILL

SCHOOL SPECIALTY

STANDARD
STATIONARY

S & S WORLDWIDE

TAMPA ENVELOPE

Tampa, FL

W
o
(Y
(Y

1930

MARKERS, PERMANENT, FELT TIP, 3 WAY, LEAK PROOF,
12 PER BOX, ORANGE, ODORLESS, SANFORD POWER
MARK NO ALTERNATES

144

each

1930

$0.12

$0.11

1940

MARKERS, PERMANENT, FELT TIP, 3 WAY, LEAK PROOF,
12 PER BOX, PURPLE, ODORLESS, SANFORD POWER
MARK NO ALTERNATES

288

each

1940

$0.12

$0.11

1950

MARKERS, PERMANENT, FELT TIP, 3 WAY, LEAK PROOF,
12 PER BOX, RED, ODORLESS, SANFORD POWER MARK
NO ALTERNATES

288

each

1950

$0.12

$0.11

1965

MARKERS, WASHABLE, 12 ASSORTED COLORS PER BOX,
WEDGE TIP (UNSCENTED), SANFORD MR. SKETCH NO
ALTERNATES

each

1965

$4.19

1970

MARKERS, WASHABLE, BLACK, 12 BOX, CHISEL TIP
(ODORLESS) EBERHARD FABER NO ALTERNATES

each

1970

1980

MARKERS, WASHABLE, BLUE, 12 PER BOX, CHISEL TIP
(ODORLESS) EBERHARD FABER NO ALTERNATES

each

1980

1990

MARKERS, WASHABLE, BROWN, 12 PER BOX, CHISEL
TIP (ODORLESS) EBERHARD FABER NO ALTERNATES

each

1990

2000

MARKERS, WASHABLE, GREEN, 12 PER BOX, CHISEL TIP
(ODORLESS) EBERHARD FABER NO ALTERNATES

each

2000

2010

MARKERS, WASHABLE, ORANGE, 12 PER BOX, CHISEL
TIP (ODORLESS) EBERHARD FABER NO ALTERNATES

each

2010
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2020 |MARKERS, WASHABLE, PURPLE, 12 PER BOX, CHISEL 0 each 2020
TIP (ODORLESS) EBERHARD FABER NO ALTERNATES
2030 |MARKERS, WASHABLE, RED, 12 PER BOX, CHISEL TIP 0 box 2030
(ODORLESS) EBERHARD FABER NO ALTERNATES
2041 |MARKER, SETS, WASHABLE, 8 COLORS BROAD LINE, 600 set 2041
#7808, CLASSIC BY CRAYOLA. NO ALTERNATES $1.90 $1.45 $4.15 $1.46 $1.89
2042 |MARKER SETS, WASHABLE, 8 COLORS, BROAD LINE, 600 set 2042
#7816-TROPICAL BY CRAYOLA NO ALTERNATES $1.90 $1.45 $3.66 $1.48 $2.05
2043 |MARKER SETS, WASHABLE, 8 COLORS, BROAD LINE, 600 set 2043
#7832-BOLD BY CRAYOLA NO ALTERNATES $1.90 $1.58 $3.83 $1.60 $1.89
2044 JMARKER SETS, WASHABLE, 6 COLORS, BROAD LINE, 288 set 2044
#7848-FLUORESCENT BY CRAYOLA NO ALTERNATES $1.56 $1.58 $1.58
2045 JMARKER SETS, WATER BASED, NON TOXIC, 12 COLORS, 0 set 2045
THIN LINE, CRAYOLA NO ALTERNATES $2.21 $7.59 $4.10
2050 [MARKERS, FINE POINT, PERMANENT INK, 12 PER BOX, 288 dozen 2050
BLACK, ODORLESS, SANFORD SHARPIE NO
ALTERNATES $5.19 $5.49 $4.95 $6.48 $7.40 $5.41
2051 |MARKERS, DRY ERASE, SET OF FOUR, #83074, 3600 set 2051
SANFORD NO ALTERNATES $2.14 $2.82 $2.69 $6.15 $3.72 $2.78
2052 |MARKERS, INDUSTRIAL, EXTRA FINE POINT, 12 PER 36 dozen 2052
BOX, BLACK, ODORLESS, SANFORD SHARPIE NO
ALTERNATES $8.40 $5.19 $11.99 $5.57
2060 JMARKERS, FINE POINT, PERMANENT INK, 12 PER BOX, 0 dozen 2060
BLUE, ODORLESS, SANFORD SHARPIE NO ALTERNATES
$5.49 $6.48 $7.60
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2080 |MARKERS, FINE POINT, PERMANENT INK, 12 PER BOX, 0 dozen 2080
ORANGE, ODORLESS, SANFORD SHARPIE NO
ALTERNATES $5.49 $7.55
2090 |MARKERS, FINE POINT, PERMANENT INK, 12 PER BOX, 72 dozen 2090
RED, ODORLESS, SANFORD SHARPIE NO ALTERNATES $5.49 | $5.19 | $6.48 | $7.55 | $7.31
2100 |MARKERS, FINE POINT, PERMANENT INK, 12 PER BOX, 0 dozen 2100
YELLOW, ODORLESS, SANFORD SHARPIE NO
ALTERNATES $5.49
2110 |MARKERS, FINE POINT, PERMANENT INK, 12 PER BOX, 0 dozen 2110
GREEN, ODORLESS, SANFORD SHARPIE NO
ALTERNATES $5.19 $6.48 $7.55
2111 |MARKERS, ULTRA FINE POINT, BLACK, 12 PER BOX, 48 dozen 2111
ODORLESS, SANFORD SHARPIE NO ALTERNATES $5.65 $5.29 $9.59 $7.55 $5.52
2130 |PAINT, FINGER, BLACK, 16 OZ. BOTTLES, CRAYOLA NO 48 bottle 2130
ALTERNATES NO ALTERNATES $1.72 $1.72
2140 |PAINT, FINGER, BLUE, 16 OZ. BOTTLES, CRAYOLA NO 48 bottle 2140
ALTERNATES $1.72 $1.72
2150 |PAINT, FINGER, BROWN, 16 OZ. BOTTLES, CRAYOLA NO| 48 bottle 2150
ALTERNATES $1.72 $1.72
2160 |PAINT, FINGER, GREEN, 16 OZ. BOTTLES, CRAYOLA NO 48 bottle 2160
ALTERNATES $1.72 $1.72
2170 |PAINT, FINGER, ORANGE, 16 OZ. BOTTLES, CRAYOLA 24 bottle 2170
NO ALTERNATES $1.72 $1.72
2180 |PAINT, FINGER, RED, 16 OZ. BOTTLES, CRAYOLA NO 48 bottle 2180
ALTERNATES $1.72 $1.72
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2190 |JPAINT, FINGER, VIOLET, 16 OZ. BOTTLES, CRAYOLA NO 24 bottle 2190
ALTERNATES $1.72 $1.72
2200 JPAINT, FINGER, WHITE, 16 OZ. BOTTLES, CRAYOLA NO 36 bottle 2200
ALTERNATES $1.72 $1.72
2210 |JPAINT, FINGER, YELLOW, 16 OZ. BOTTLES, CRAYOLA NO 48 bottle 2210
ALTERNATES $1.72 $1.72
2390 |JPAINT, TEMPERA POWDER, BLACK, 1 POUND CAN, 0 can 2390
CRAYOLA PREMIER NO ALTERNATES $3.15 $1.89
2400 JPAINT, TEMPERA POWDER, BLUE, 1 POUND CAN, 48 can 2400
CRAYOLA PREMIER NO ALTERNATES $3.15 $1.89
2410 |JPAINT, TEMPERA POWDER, BROWN, 1 POUND CAN, 0 can 2410
CRAYOLA PREMIER NO ALTERNATES $3.15 $1.89
2430 |JPAINT, TEMPERA POWDER, GREEN, 1 POUND CAN, 24 can 2430
CRAYOLA PREMIER NO ALTERNATES $3.15 $1.89
2440 JPAINT, TEMPERA POWDER, MAGENTA, 1 POUND CAN, 0 can 2440
CRAYOLA PREMIER NO ALTERNATES $4.75 $1.89
2450 |PAINT, TEMPERA POWDER, ORANGE, 1 POUND CAN, 0 can 2450
CRAYOLA PREMIER NO ALTERNATES $3.15 $1.89
2460 |JPAINT, TEMPERA POWDER, PEACH, 1 POUND CAN, 0 can 2460
CRAYOLA PREMIER NO ALTERNATES $4.75 $1.89
2465 |PAINT, TEMPERA POWDER, RED, 1 POUND CAN, 0 can 2465
CRAYOLA PREMIER NO ALTERNATES $3.15 $1.89
2480 |JPAINT, TEMPERA POWDER, TURQUOISE, 1 POUND 48 can 2480
CAN, CRAYOLA PREMIER NO ALTERNATES $4.75 $1.89
2490 |JPAINT, TEMPERA POWDER, VIOLET, 1 POUND CAN, 48 can 2490
CRAYOLA PREMIER NO ALTERNATES $3.15 $1.89
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2500 |PAINT, TEMPERA POWDER, WHITE, 1 POUND CAN, 0 can 2500
CRAYOLA PREMIER NO ALTERNATES $3.15 $1.89
2510 |PAINT, TEMPERA POWDER, YELLOW, 1 POUND CAN, 0 can 2510
CRAYOLA PREMIER NO ALTERNATES $3.15 $1.89
2525 |PAINT, WATER COLOR, 8 ASSORTED COLORS SEMI- 144 set 2525
MOIST, OVAL, 1/2 PAN WITH BRUSH, NON-TOXIC,
CRAYOLA NO ALTERNATES $1.18 $1.30 $2.28
2526 |PAINT, WATER COLOR "SO BIG", 4 COLORS, OVAL, PAN 144 set 2526
SET, CRAYOLA NO ALTERNATES $1.84 $3.99 $1.85
2740 |PAINT, TEMPERA, LIQUID, 16 OZ. BOTTLE, BLACK, 144 bottle 2740
CRAYOLA PREMIER NO ALTERNATES $1.81 $1.82
2750 |PAINT, TEMPERA, LIQUID, 16 OZ. BOTTLE, BLUE, 144 bottle 2750
CRAYOLA PREMIER NO ALTERNATES $1.81 $1.82
2760 |PAINT, TEMPERA, LIQUID, 16 OZ. BOTTLE, BROWN, 144 bottle 2760
CRAYOLA PREMIER NO ALTERNATES $1.81 $1.82
2770 |PAINT, TEMPERA, LIQUID, 16 OZ. BOTTLE, GREEN, 144 bottle 2770
CRAYOLA PREMIER NO ALTERNATES $1.81 $1.82
2780 |PAINT, TEMPERA, LIQUID, 16 OZ. BOTTLE, MAGENTA, 72 bottle 2780
CRAYOLA PREMIER NO ALTERNATES $1.81 $1.82
2790 |PAINT, TEMPERA, LIQUID, 16 OZ. BOTTLE, ORANGE, 72 bottle 2790
CRAYOLA PREMIER NO ALTERNATES $1.81 $1.82
2800 |PAINT, TEMPERA, LIQUID, 16 OZ. BOTTLE, PEACH, 72 bottle 2800
CRAYOLA PREMIER NO ALTERNATES $1.81 $1.82
2810 |PAINT, TEMPERA, LIQUID, 16 OZ. BOTTLE, RED, 144 bottle 2810
CRAYOLA PREMIER NO ALTERNATES $1.81 $1.82
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Florida Preference (per FS 287.084)

No Bid

2820

PAINT, TEMPERA, LIQUID, 16 OZ. BOTTLE, TURQUOISE,
CRAYOLA PREMIER NO ALTERNATES

72

bottle

2820

Hollywood, FI

AFP

Delray Beach, FI

DGS

NATIONAL ART &
SCHOOL SUPPLY

PYRAMID
Tampa, Fl

QUILL

SCHOOL SPECIALTY

STANDARD
STATIONARY

S & S WORLDWIDE

TAMPA ENVELOPE

Tampa, FL

-
L=
(o]
=

$1.82

2830

PAINT, TEMPERA, LIQUID, 16 OZ. BOTTLE, VIOLET,
CRAYOLA PREMIER NO ALTERNATES

72

bottle

2830

$1.81

$1.82

2840

PAINT, TEMPERA, LIQUID, 16 OZ. BOTTLE, WHITE,
CRAYOLA PREMIER NO ALTERNATES

288

bottle

2840

$1.81

$1.82

2850

PAINT, TEMPERA, LIQUID, 16 OZ. BOTTLE, YELLOW,
CRAYOLA PREMIER NO ALTERNATES

144

bottle

2850

$1.81

$1.82

2860

PADS, CANARY, HANDY, 5" X 8", 3/8" RULED BOTH
SIDES, WITH MARGIN LINE, PERFORATED AT TOP

1200

each

2860

$0.26

$0.26

$11.19

$0.19

$0.31

2865

PADS, CANARY, LETTER, 8 1/2" X 11", 3/8" RULED
BOTH SIDES, WITH MARGIN LINE, 50 SHEETS PER PAD,
PERFORATED AT TOP

576

each

2865

$0.44

$0.44

$6.02

$0.41

$0.50

2870

PADS, CANARY, LEGAL, 8 1/2" X 14", 3/8" RULED BOTH
SIDES, WITH MARGIN LINE, 50 SHEETS PER PAD,
PERFORATED AT TOP

144

each

2870

$0.57

$0.57

$12.79

$0.58

$0.70

2880

PADS, STENOGRAPHERS, 6" X 9", 3/8" RULED BOTH
SIDES, WITH CENTER PAGE MARGIN LINE, GREEN TINT,
80 SHEETS PER PAD, RIVERSIDE, B&J

144

each

2880

$1.25

$0.58

$10.79

$0.76

$0.66

2890

PAPER, ART, 8"X10 1/2" RULED HALF PAGE, BOTH
SIDES, SHORT WAY, WHITE, 500 SHEETS/REAM,
PACON, RIVERSIDE, B&J

ream

2890

3100

PAPER, CHART, WHITE, BOND, #16, 24" X 32", 1/2"
RULED BOTH SIDES WITH 3/4" GUIDELINES SHORT
WAY, 100 SHEETS PER PACKAGE

pack

3100

$6.95
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School Supplies for the District Warehouse
Bid Opening: January 28, 2015 @ 2:00 p.m.

Awarded by ltem

Awarded by Group

Florida Preference (per FS 287.084)

No Bid

3200

PAPER, CHART TABLET, 24" X 32", WHITE, BOND, 1"
RULED SHORT WAY, WITHOUT GUIDELINES, 2 HOLE
PUNCH

72

each

3200

Hollywood, FI

AFP

Delray Beach, FI

DGS

NATIONAL ART &
SCHOOL SUPPLY

PYRAMID
Tampa, Fl

QUILL

SCHOOL SPECIALTY

STANDARD
STATIONARY

S & S WORLDWIDE

TAMPA ENVELOPE

Tampa, FL

w
N
w
N

$7.19

$2.36

3210

PAPER, CHART TABLET, WHITE BOND, STIFF BACK, 24"
X 16", 1/2" RULED LONGWAY WITH 3/4" GUIDELINES,
2 HOLE PUNCH

72

each

3210

3220

PAPER, CHART TABLET, 24" X 32", WHITE, BOND, 1/5"
RULED SHORT WAY WITH 3/4" GUIDELINES, 2 HOLE
PUNCH, WIRE BOUND TOP, 25 SHEETS PER TABLET

72

each

3220

$2.34

$2.33

3230

PAPER, CONSTRUCTION, 9" X 12", 50 SHEETS PER
PACK, SUB 80 ASSORTED, 100% VAT DYED SULPHITE,
FADE RESISTANT, TRU-RAY BY RIVERSIDE

300

pack

3230

$1.31

$1.31

$1.03

$1.33

$1.22

3240

PAPER, CONSTRUCTION, 9" X 12", BLACK, 50 SHEETS
PER PACK, SUB 80, 100% VAT DYED SULPHITE, FADE
RESISTANT, TRU-RAY BY RIVERSIDE, 57SC

400

pack

3240

$1.04

$1.04

$1.03

$1.06

$1.19

3250

PAPER, CONSTRUCTION, 9" X 12", BLUE SKY, 50 SHEETS
PER PACK, SUB 80, 100% VAT DYED SULPHITE, FADE
RESISTANT, TRU-RAY BY RIVERSIDE, 21SC

250

pack

3250

$1.11

$1.10

$1.03

$1.13

$1.19

3270

PAPER, CONSTRUCTION, 9" X 12", TAN, 50 SHEETS PER
PACK, SUB 80, 100% VAT DYED SULPHITE, FADE
RESISTANT, TRU-RAY BY RIVERSIDE, 49SC

300

pack

3270

$1.10

$1.10

$1.12

$1.19

3280

PAPER, CONSTRUCTION, 9" X 12", SLATE, 50 SHEETS
PER PACK, SUB 80, 100% VAT DYED SULPHITE, FADE
RESISTANT, TRU-RAY BY RIVERSIDE, 565C

300

pack

3280

$1.17

$1.16

$1.19

$1.19
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Awarded by ltem

Awarded by Group

Florida Preference (per FS 287.084)

No Bid

3290

PAPER, CONSTRUCTION, 9" X 12", LIME BRILLIANT, 50
SHEETS PER PACK, SUB 80, 100% VAT DYED SULPHITE,
FADE RESISTANT, TRU-RAY BY RIVERSIDE, 10SC

300

pack

3290

Hollywood, FI

AFP

DGS

Delray Beach, FI

NATIONAL ART &
SCHOOL SUPPLY

PYRAMID
Tampa, Fl

QUILL

SCHOOL SPECIALTY

STANDARD

STATIONARY

S & S WORLDWIDE

TAMPA ENVELOPE

Tampa, FL

$1.03

$1.32

$1.19

3295

PAPER, CONSTRUCTION, 9" X 12", GREEN FESTIVE, 50
SHEETS PER PACK, SUB 80, 100% VAT DYED SULPHITE,
FADE RESISTANT, TRU-RAY BY RIVERSIDE, 75C

100

pack

3295

$1.03

$1.38

$1.19

3300

PAPER, CONSTRUCTION, 9" X 12", MAGENTA, 50
SHEETS PER PACK, SUB 80, 100% VAT DYED SULPHITE,
FADE RESISTANT, TRU-RAY BY RIVERSIDE, 15C

300

pack

3300

$1.30

$1.19

3310

PAPER, CONSTRUCTION, 9" X 12", PUMPKIN, 50
SHEETS PER PACK, SUB 80, 100% VAT DYED SULPHITE,
FADE RESISTANT, TRU-RAY BY RIVERSIDE, 27SC

100

pack

3310

$1.18

$1.18

$1.20

$1.19

3330

PAPER, CONSTRUCTION, 9" X 12", SALMON, 50 SHEETS
PER PACK, SUB 80, 100% VAT DYED SULPHITE, FADE
RESISTANT TRU-RAY BY RIVERSIDE, 12SC

300

pack

3330

$1.30

$1.29

$1.32

$1.19

3340

PAPER, CONSTRUCTION, 9" X 12", LILAC, 50 SHEETS
PER PACK, SUB 80, 100% VAT DYED SULPHITE, FADE
RESISTANT, TRU-RAY BY RIVERSIDE, 24SC

100

pack

3340

$1.11

$1.10

$1.03

$1.13

$1.19

3350

PAPER, CONSTRUCTION, 9" X 12", RED FESTIVE, 50
SHEETS PER PACK, SUB 80, 100% VAT DYED SULPHITE,
FADE RESISTANT, TRU-RAY BY RIVERSIDE, 83SC

100

pack

3350

$1.15

$1.20

$1.22

$1.19

3360

PAPER, CONSTRUCTION, 9" X 12", SCARLET, 50 SHEETS
PER PACK, SUB 80, 100% VAT DYED SULPHITE, FADE
RESISTANT, TRU-RAY BY RIVERSIDE, 9SC

50

pack

3360

$1.28

$1.28

$1.30

$1.19
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Awarded by ltem

Awarded by Group

Florida Preference (per FS 287.084)

No Bid

3370

PAPER, CONSTRUCTION, 9" X 12", TURQUOISE, 50
SHEETS PER PACK, SUB 80, 100% VAT DYED SULPHITE,
FADE RESISTANT, TRU-RAY BY RIVERSIDE, 85C

300

pack

3370

Hollywood, FI

AFP

DGS

Delray Beach, FI

NATIONAL ART &
SCHOOL SUPPLY

PYRAMID
Tampa, Fl

QUILL

SCHOOL SPECIALTY

STANDARD

STATIONARY

S & S WORLDWIDE

TAMPA ENVELOPE

Tampa, FL

$1.03

$1.30

$1.19

3380

PAPER, CONSTRUCTION, 9" X 12", YELLLOW LIGHT, 50
SHEETS PER PACK, SUB 80, 100% VAT DYED SULPHITE,
FADE RESISTANT TRU-RAY BY RIVERSIDE, 175C

300

pack

3380

$1.03

$1.16

$1.19

3390

PAPER, CONSTRUCTION, 12" X 18", ASSORTED, 50
SHEETS PER PACK, SUB 80, 100% VAT DYED SULPHITE,
FADE RESISTANT, TRU-RAY BY RIVERSIDE, 85C

300

pack

3390

$2.58

$2.56

$2.05

$2.60

§2.53

3400

PAPER, CONSTRUCTION, 12" X 18", BLACK, 50 SHEETS
PER PACK, SUB 80, 100% VAT DYED SULPHITE, FADE
RESISTANT, TRU-RAY BY RIVERSIDE, 575C

200

pack

3400

$1.99

$1.98

$2.05

§2.01

$2.39

3410

PAPER, CONSTRUCTION, 12" X 18", ROYAL BLUE, 50
SHEETS PER PACK, SUB 80, 100% VAT DYED SULPHITE,
FADE RESISTANT, TRU-RAY BY RIVERSIDE, 22SC

400

pack

3410

$2.38

$2.37

$2.05

$2.40

$2.39

3420

PAPER, CONSTRUCTION, 12" X 18", WARM BROWN, 50
SHEETS PER PACK, SUB 80, 100% VAT DYED SULPHITE,
FADE RESISTANT, TRU-RAY BY RIVERSIDE, 51SC

300

pack

3420

$2.10

$2.09

$2.05

$2.12

$2.39

3421

PAPER, CONSTRUCTION, 12" X 18", TAN, 50 SHEETS
PER PACK, SUB 80, 100% VAT DYED SULPHITE, FADE
RESISTANT, TRU-RAY BY RIVERSIDE, 49SC

100

pack

3421

$2.11

$2.10

$2.13

$2.39

3440

PAPER, CONSTRUCTION, 12" X 18", SPRING GREEN, 50
SHEETS PER PACK, SUB 80, 100% VAT DYED SULPHITE,
FADE RESISTANT, TRU-RAY BY RIVERSIDE, 265C

150

pack

3440

$2.38

$2.36

$2.39
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Awarded by ltem

Awarded by Group

Florida Preference (per FS 287.084)

No Bid

3441

PAPER, CONSTRUCTION, 12" X 18", TURQUOISE, 50
SHEETS PER PACK, SUB 80, 100% VAT DYED SULPHITE,
FADE RESISTANT, TRU-RAY BY RIVERSIDE, 85C

100

pack

3441

Hollywood, FI

AFP

DGS

Delray Beach, FI

NATIONAL ART &
SCHOOL SUPPLY

PYRAMID
Tampa, Fl

QUILL

SCHOOL SPECIALTY

STANDARD

STATIONARY

S & S WORLDWIDE

TAMPA ENVELOPE

Tampa, FL

wr
g
>
Y

$4.39

$2.49

$2.39

3445

PAPER, CONSTRUCTION, 12" X 18", FESTIVE GREEN, 50
SHEETS PER PACK, SUB 80, 100% VAT DYED SULPHITE,
FADE RESISTANT, TRU-RAY BY RIVERSIDE, 75C

200

pack

3445

$2.62

$2.60

$2.05

$2.64

$2.39

3446

PAPER, CONSTRUCTION, 12" X 18", LIME BRILLIANT, 50
SHEETS PER PACK, SUB 80, 100% VAT DYED SULPHITE,
FADE RESISTANT, TRU-RAY BY RIVERSIDE, 10SC

50

pack

3446

$2.50

$2.48

$2.05

$2.52

$2.39

3460

PAPER, CONSTRUCTION, 12" X 18", PUMPKIN, 50
SHEETS PER PACK, SUB 80, 100% VAT DYED SULPHITE,
FADE RESISTANT, TRU-RAY BY RIVERSIDE, 27SC

200

pack

3460

$2.25

$2.24

§2.27

$2.39

3461

PAPER, CONSTRUCTION, 12" X 18", SALMON, 50
SHEETS PER PACK, SUB 80, 100% VAT DYED SULPHITE,
FADE RESISTANT, TRU-RAY BY RIVERSIDE, 125C

pack

3461

$2.50

$2.47

$2.52

$2.39

3480

PAPER, CONSTRUCTION, 12" X 18", PINK, 50 SHEETS
PER PACK, SUB 80, 100% VAT DYED SULPHITE, FADE
RESISTANT, TRU-RAY BY RIVERSIDE, 14SC

200

pack

3480

$2.30

$2.29

$2.05

$2.32

$2.39

3490

PAPER, CONSTRUCTION, 12" X 18", VIOLET, 50 SHEETS
PER PACK, SUB 80, 100% VAT DYED SULPHITE, FADE
RESISTANT, TRU-RAY BY RIVERSIDE, 11SC

100

pack

3490

$2.25

$2.24

$2.05

§2.27

$2.39
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Florida Preference (per FS 287.084)

No Bid

3491

PAPER, CONSTRUCTION, 12" X 18", LILAC, 50 SHEETS
PER PACK, SUB 80, 100% VAT DYED SULPHITE, FADE
RESISTANT TRU-RAY BY RIVERSIDE, 24SC

pack

3491

Hollywood, FI

AFP

DGS

Delray Beach, FI

NATIONAL ART &
SCHOOL SUPPLY

PYRAMID
Tampa, Fl

QUILL

SCHOOL SPECIALTY

STANDARD

STATIONARY

S & S WORLDWIDE

TAMPA ENVELOPE

Tampa, FL

W
!\)
[ERN
D

$2.05

$2.16

$2.39

3492

PAPER, CONSTRUCTION, 12" X 18", MAGENTA, 50
SHEETS PER PACK, SUB 80, 100% VAT DYED SULPHITE,
FADE RESISTANT, TRU-RAY BY RIVERSIDE, 15C

pack

3492

$2.45

$2.42

$2.47

$2.39

3500

PAPER, CONSTRUCTION, 12" X 18", FESTIVE RED, 50
SHEETS PER PACK, SUB 80, 100% VAT DYED SULPHITE,
FADE RESISTANT, TRU-RAY BY RIVERSIDE, 83SC

200

pack

3500

$2.28

$2.27

$2.05

$2.30

$2.39

3510

PAPER, CONSTRUCTION, 12" X 18", LIGHT RED, 50
SHEETS PER PACK, SUB 80, 100% VAT DYED SULPHITE,
FADE RESISTANT, TRU-RAY BY RIVERSIDE, 13SC

200

pack

3510

$2.21

$2.39

3520

PAPER, CONSTRUCTION, 12" X 18", YELLOW, 50 SHEETS
PER PACK, SUB 80, 100% VAT DYED SULPHITE, FADE
RESISTANT, TRU-RAY BY RIVERSIDE, 5SC

500

pack

3520

$2.25

$2.22

$2.05

§2.27

$2.39

3521

PAPER, CONSTRUCTION, 12" X 18", LIGHT YELLOW, 50
SHEETS PER PACK, SUB 80, 100% VAT DYED SULPHITE,
FADE RESISTANT, TRU-RAY BY RIVERSIDE, 17SC

pack

3521

$2.16

$2.14

$2.18

$2.39

3522

PAPER, CONSTRUCTION, 12" X 18", GOLD, 50 SHEETS
PER PACK, SUB 80, 100% VAT DYED SULPHITE, FADE
RESISTANT, TRU-RAY BY RIVERSIDE

50

pack

3522

$2.21

$2.20

§2.23

$2.39

3530

PAPER, CONSTRUCTION, 18" X 24", ASSORTED, 50
SHEETS PER PACK, SUB 80, 100% VAT DYED SULPHITE,
FADE RESISTANT, TRU-RAY BY RIVERSIDE, 85C

105

pack

3530

$5.70

$5.09

$5.76

$5.74
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3540

PAPER, CONSTRUCTION, 18" X 24", BLACK, 50 SHEETS
PER PACK, SUB 80, 100% VAT DYED SULPHITE, FADE
RESISTANT, TRU-RAY BY RIVERSIDE, 57SC

105

pack

3540

Hollywood, FI

AFP

DGS

Delray Beach, FI

NATIONAL ART &
SCHOOL SUPPLY

PYRAMID
Tampa, Fl

QUILL

SCHOOL SPECIALTY

STANDARD

STATIONARY

S & S WORLDWIDE

TAMPA ENVELOPE

Tampa, FL

wr
>
i
N

$4.46

$5.62

3550

PAPER, CONSTRUCTION, 18" X 24", SKY BLUE, 50
SHEETS PER PACK, SUB 80, 100% VAT DYED SULPHITE,
FADE RESISTANT, TRU-RAY BY RIVERSIDE, 21SC

100

pack

3550

$4.72

$4.59

$4.76

$5.74

3560

PAPER, CONSTRUCTION, 18" X 24", BLUE, 50 SHEETS
PER PACK, SUB 80, 100% VAT DYED SULPHITE, FADE
RESISTANT, TRU-RAY BY RIVERSIDE, 33SC

100

pack

3560

$5.19

$4.99

$5.25

$5.74

3570

PAPER, CONSTRUCTION, 18" X 24", DARK BROWN, 50
SHEETS PER PACK, SUB 80, 100% VAT DYED SULPHITE,
FADE RESISTANT, TRU-RAY BY RIVERSIDE, 50SC

30

pack

3570

$4.89

$4.86

$4.93

$5.74

3590

PAPER, CONSTRUCTION, 18" X 24", DARK GREEN, 50
SHEETS PER PACK, SUB 80, 100% VAT DYED SULPHITE,
FADE RESISTANT, TRU-RAY BY RIVERSIDE, 31SC

45

pack

3590

$5.38

$5.33

$5.44

$5.74

3610

PAPER, CONSTRUCTION, 18" X 24", ORANGE, 50
SHEETS PER PACK, SUB 80, 100% VAT DYED SULPHITE,
FADE RESISTANT, TRU-RAY BY RIVERSIDE, 35C

60

pack

3610

$4.98

$4.95

$5.03

$5.74

3630

PAPER, CONSTRUCTION, 18" X 24", SHOCKING PINK, 50

SHEETS PER PACK, SUB 80, 100% VAT DYED SULPHITE,
FADE RESISTANT, TRU-RAY BY RIVERSIDE, 15SC

60

pack

3630

$5.31

$5.29

$5.37

$5.62
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3640

PAPER, CONSTRUCTION, 18" X 24", MAGENTA, 50
SHEETS PER PACK, SUB 80, 100% VAT DYED SULPHITE,
FADE RESISTANT, TRU-RAY BY RIVERSIDE, 1SC

60

pack

3640

Hollywood, FI

AFP

DGS

Delray Beach, FI

NATIONAL ART &
SCHOOL SUPPLY

PYRAMID
Tampa, Fl

QUILL

SCHOOL SPECIALTY

STANDARD

STATIONARY

S & S WORLDWIDE

TAMPA ENVELOPE

Tampa, FL

w
hd
U
00

$5.64

$5.74

3650

PAPER, CONSTRUCTION, 18" X 24", SCARLET, 50
SHEETS PER PACK, SUB 80, 100% VAT DYED SULPHITE,
FADE RESISTANT, TRU-RAY BY RIVERSIDE, 95C

pack

3650

$5.60

$5.54

$5.66

$5.74

3660

PAPER, CONSTRUCTION, 18" X 24", FESTIVE RED, 50
SHEETS PER PACK, SUB 80, 100% VAT DYED SULPHITE,
FADE RESISTANT, TRU-RAY BY RIVERSIDE, 83SC

60

pack

3660

$5.22

$5.15

$5.28

$5.74

3670

PAPER, CONSTRUCTION, 18" X 24", FESTIVE GREEN, 50
SHEETS PER PACK, SUB 80, 100% VAT DYED SULPHITE,
FADE RESISTANT, TRU-RAY BY RIVERSIDE, 75C

45

pack

3670

$5.66

$5.49

$5.72

$5.74

3680

PAPER, CONSTRUCTION, 18" X 24", YELLOW, 50 SHEETS
PER PACK, SUB 80, 100% VAT DYED SULPHITE, FADE
RESISTANT, TRU-RAY BY RIVERSIDE, 55C

60

pack

3680

$4.92

$4.85

$4.96

$5.74

3690

PAPER, DRAWING, 9" X 12", WHITE, 500 SHEETS PER
REAM, SUB 80 BASIC, TRU-RAY BY PACON, NO
ALTERNATES

300

ream

3690

$6.69

$6.65

3710

PAPER, DRAWING, 12" X 18", WHITE, 500 SHEETS PER
REAM, SULFITE, SUB 80 BASIC, TRU-RAY BY PACON, NO
ALTERNATES

ream

3710

$13.26

$13.19

3720

PAPER, DRAWING, 12" X 18", MANILA, 500 SHEETS PER
REAM, SULFITE, SUB 80 BASIC, PACON NO

ALTERNATES

ream

3720

$9.04

$8.99

$14.04
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3740

PAPER, DRAWING, 18" X 24", WHITE, 500 SHEETS PER
REAM, SULFITE, SUB 80 BASIC, RIVERSIDE

ream

3740

Hollywood, FI

AFP

Delray Beach, FI

DGS

NATIONAL ART &
SCHOOL SUPPLY

PYRAMID
Tampa, Fl

QUILL

SCHOOL SPECIALTY

STANDARD

STATIONARY

S & S WORLDWIDE

TAMPA ENVELOPE

Tampa, FL

w
N
o
o))
~

$26.54

$30.40

3750

PAPER, DUPLICATING, BLUE, COPY, MULTI-PURPOSE, 8
1/2" X 11", SUB 20, 500 SHEETS PER REAM

1200

ream

3750

$5.24

$4.23

3760

PAPER, DUPLICATING, BUFF, COPY, MULTI-PURPOSE, 8
1/2" X 11", SUB 20, 500 SHEETS PER REAM

800

ream

3760

$4.23

3770

PAPER, DUPLICATING, CANARY, COPY, MULTI-
PURPOSE, 8 1/2" X 11", 500 SHEETS PER REAM

1200

ream

3770

$5.24

$4.23

3780

PAPER, DUPLICATING, GREEN, COPY, MULTI-PURPOSE,
81/2" X 11", 500 SHEETS PER REAM

1200

ream

3780

$5.24

$4.23

3790

PAPER, DUPLICATING, PINK, COPY, MULTI-PURPOSE, 8
1/2" X 11", 500 SHEETS PER REAM

1200

ream

3790

$5.24

$4.23

3820

PAPER, FINGER PAINT, 16" X 22", WHITE, 100 SHEETS
PER PACKAGE, B&J

pack

3820

$2.86

$6.95

$2.83

3875

PAPER, FIRST GRADE "SPACE SPECIAL", 8" X 10 1/2", 1"
RULED LONG WAY WITH 1/2" DOTTED GUIDELINE,
WITH 1/2" LINE SPACE, WHITE, 500 SHEETS PER REAM,
B&J OR RIVERSIDE

ream

3875

$2.36

$2.77

3885

PAPER, SECOND GRADE, "SPACE SPECIAL", 8" X 10
1/2", 3/4" RULED LONG WAY WITH 3/8" DOTTED
GUIDELINE, 1/2" LINE SPACE, WHITE, 500 SHEETS PER
REAM, B&J OR RIVERSIDE

ream

3885

$3.06

3900

PAPER, THIRD GRADE, "SPACE SPECIAL", 8 1/2" X 10
1/2", RULED LONG WAY WITH 1/4" DOTTED GUIDELINE
AND 1/4" LINE SPACE, 500 SHEETS PER REAM, B&J OR

RIVERSIDE

ream

3900
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3970

PAPER, THEME, 8" X 10 1/2", 3/8" RULING SHORT WAY
BOTH SIDES, SUB 16, WITH RED LEFT MARGIN,
UNPUNCHED, 500 SHEETS PER REAM, B&J OR
RIVERSIDE

ream

3970

Hollywood, FI

AFP

Delray Beach, FI

DGS

NATIONAL ART &
SCHOOL SUPPLY

PYRAMID
Tampa, Fl

QUILL

SCHOOL SPECIALTY

STANDARD
STATIONARY

S & S WORLDWIDE

TAMPA ENVELOPE

Tampa, FL

$7.95

$2.55

3980

PAPER, THEME, 8" X 10 1/2", FIVE HOLES, RULED ON
BOTH SIDES 11/32" SHORT WAY, SUB 16, WITH RED
LEFT MARGIN, 500 SHEETS PER REAM, B&J OR
RIVERSIDE

ream

3980

$7.95

$79.99

$2.65

3990

PAPER, KRAFT, BLACK, 36" WIDE, 1000 FT. ROLL, 100%
VAT DYED SULPHITE, FADE RESISTANT, 40 LBS,
DECOROL 57SP

12

roll

3990

$30.17

$30.09

§76.24

$40.14

4000

PAPER, KRAFT, BLUE, 36" WIDE, 1000 FT. ROLL, 100%
VAT DYED SULPHITE, FADE RESISTANT, 40 LBS,
DECOROL 33SP

10

roll

4000

$32.61

$27.75

$82.40

$38.06

4020

PAPER, KRAFT, BROWN, 36" WIDE, 1000 FT. ROLL,
100% VAT DYED SULPHITE, FADE RESISTANT, 40 LBS,
DECOROL 50SP

roll

4020

$27.20

$83.24

4030

PAPER, KRAFT, GREEN, 36" WIDE, 1000 FT. ROLL, 100%
VAT DYED SULPHITE, FADE RESISTANT, 40 LBS,
DECOROL 7SP

roll

4030

$25.93

$90.14

4040

PAPER, KRAFT, RED, 36" WIDE, 1000 FT. ROLL, 100%
VAT DYED SULPHITE, FADE RESISTANT, 40 LBS,
DECOROL 83SP

roll

4040

$34.14

$83.94

4060

PAPER, KRAFT, WHITE, 36" WIDE, 1000 FT. ROLL, 100%
VAT DYED SULPHITE, FADE RESISTANT, 40 LBS,
DECOROL 53SP

roll

4060

$26.68

$78.55
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4070 |PAPER, KRAFT, YELLOW, 36" WIDE, 1000 FT. ROLL, 10 roll 4070
100% VAT DYED SULPHITE, FADE RESISTANT, 40 LBS,
DECOROL 5SP $32.61 $82.40 | $42.85
4190 |PAPER, NEWSPRINT, PLAIN, 9" X 12", 500 SHEETS PER 0 ream 4190
REAM, SUB 32, UNRULED, B&J OR RIVERSIDE $2.09
4310 |PAPER, POSTER BOARD, BLACK, 22" X 28", 6 PLY, ONE 500 sheet 4310
SIDE COLORED, 100 SHEETS PER PACKAGE, BEVERIDGE
$0.23 $0.24 $0.28
4320 |PAPER, POSTER BOARD, BLUE, 22" X 28", 6 PLY, ONE 300 sheet 4320
SIDE COLORED, 100 SHEETS PER PACKAGE, BEVERIDGE
$0.23 $0.24 $0.28
4330 |PAPER, POSTER BOARD, GREEN, 22" X 28", 6 PLY, ONE 200 sheet 4330
SIDE COLORED, 100 SHEETS PER PACKAGE, BEVERIDGE
$0.23 $0.24 $0.28
4340 |PAPER, POSTER BOARD, ORANGE, 22" X 28", 6 PLY, 200 sheet 4340
ONE SIDE COLORED, 100 SHEETS PER PACKAGE,
BEVERIDGE $0.23 $0.24 $0.28
4350 |PAPER, POSTER BOARD, RED, 22" X 28", 6 PLY, ONE 200 sheet 4350
SIDE COLORED, 100 SHEETS PER PACKAGE, BEVERIDGE
$0.23 $0.24 $0.28
4360 |PAPER, POSTER BOARD, WHITE, 22" X 28", 6 PLY, ONE 1000 sheet 4360
SIDE COLORED, 100 SHEETS PER PACKAGE, BEVERIDGE
$0.21 $0.22 $0.21
4370 |PAPER, POSTER BOARD, YELLOW, 22" X 28", 6 PLY, ONE 500 sheet 4370
SIDE COLORED, 100 SHEETS PER PACKAGE, BEVERIDGE
$0.23 $0.24 $0.28
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4410 |PAPER, SENTENCE STRIPS, 3" X 24", RULED 1 1/2" 300 pack 4410
GUIDELINE, ONE SIDE, HEAVY TAG BD $2.15 $1.22 $3.19 $1.23
4420 |PAPER, TAGBOARD, WHITE, 18" X 24", 100 SHEETS PER 0 pack 4420
PACKAGE, SUB 150 $10.17
4475 |PAPER, TISSUE-ART, CLASSROOM PACK, 12" X 18", 200 pack 4475
ASSORTED COLORS, 50 SHEETS PER PACKAGE, SPECTRA
NO. 5852 $2.89 $1.95 $1.99 $1.94
4477 |PAPER, TISSUE-ART, SCHOOL PACK, 20" X 30", 100 pack 4477
ASSORTED COLORS, 20 SHEETS PER PACKAGE, FOLDED,
SPECTRA $2.42 $1.71 $5.24 S1.74 $1.70
4540 |PENCILS, PRIMARY, LARGE WITH ERASER, 12 PER BOX, 576 dozen 4540
EBONY $3.96 $1.62 $3.34 $1.39
4600 [PENCILS, DRAWING, #2, SOFT BONDED LEAD, 12 PER 0 dozen 4600
BOX, EBONY #1135359 $3.39 $4.11
4620 JPENCILS, LEAD #2 WITH ERASER, 144 PER BOX, MUST 1000 gross 4620
WORK WITH ELECTRONIC SCANNERS, DIXON
TICONDEROGA #13882 OR SANFORD MIRADO #02097 $18.51 $18.84 $12.42 $12.60 $20.28 $5.74
4640 |PENCILS, ART, COLORED, SET OF 24, ASSORTED 1008 set 4640
COLORS, COLOR ART BY PRANG $2.52 $2.57 $1.39 $1.28 $1.24
4911 |PENS, ROLLER BALL, TYPE, BLACK INK, 12 PER BOX, 288 dozen 4911
METAL POINT UNI-BALL DELUXE BY SANFORD, .3M $14.28 | $3.36 $12.70
4912 |PENS, ROLLER BALL, TYPE, RED INK, 12 PER BOX, 144 dozen 4912
METAL POINT, UNI-BALL DELUXE BY SANFORD, .3M $14.28 $3.36 $12.70
4920 |PENS, BALL POINT, BLACK INK, FINE POINT, 12 PER 288 dozen 4920
PACKAGE, PAPERMATE $0.80 $1.43 $0.60 $0.93
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4930 JPENS, BALL POINT, BLUE INK, FINE POINT, 12 PER 144 dozen 4930
PACKAGE, PAPERMATE $0.80 $1.43 $0.60 $0.93
4950 |PENS, BALL POINT, RED INK, FINE POINT, 12 PER 144 dozen 4950
PACKAGE, PAPERMATE $0.80 $2.23 $0.60 S1.01
4960 |PENS, BALL POINT, BLACK INK, MEDIUM POINT, 12 PER 288 dozen 4960
PACKAGE, PAPERMATE $0.80 $1.43 $0.60 $0.93
4970 |PENS, BALL POINT, BLUE INK, MEDIUM POINT, 12 PER 288 dozen 4970
PACKAGE, PAPERMATE $0.80 $1.99 $0.60 $0.93
4980 |PENS, BALL POINT, GREEN INK, MEDIUM POINT, 12 PER 144 dozen 4980
PACKAGE, PAPERMATE $0.80 $1.68 $1.01
4990 |PENS, BALL PINT, RED INK, MEDIUM POINT, 12 PER 144 dozen 4990
PACKAGE, PAPERMATE $0.80 $1.99 $0.60 $0.93
5220 |RUBBER BANDS, 3" X 1/8" X 1/32", 1/4 LB. BOX 144 box 5220 $0.69 S0.71 $0.46
5240 |RULERS, PLASTIC, 12" X 1/8", WITH 16TH INCH 600 each 5240
MARKING ON ONE EDGE AND MILLIMETER RULING ON
THE OTHER, WESTCOTT $0.12 $0.71 $1.02 $0.09
5250 |RULERS, WOODEN, 12" X 7/8" WITH 16TH INCH 600 each 5250
MARKING ON ONE EDGE WITHOUT METAL GUIDE
EDGE, MILLIMETER RULING ON THE OTHER, WESTCOTT
$0.29 $0.30 $0.16 $0.17 $0.10
5255 |SCISSORS, 5", KINDERGARTEN, BOTH RIGHT AND LEFT 0 dozen 5255
HAND CUT, BLUNT, FISKARS, FKR9416 NO ALTERNATES
$15.36 $35.40 $15.39 $15.99
5260 |SCISSORS, 5" RIGHT AND LEFT HANDED, POINTED, 12 0 dozen 5260
PER BOX, FISKARS, FKR9430 NO ALTERNATES $15.36 $35.40 $15.39 $15.99
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5270 |SCISSOR, 7" RIGHT AND LEFT HANDED, POINTED, 12 0 dozen 5270
PER BOX, FISKARS, FKR9458 NO ALTERNATES $22.56 $71.40 $21.60 $28.32
5290 |SHARPENERS, PENCIL, ADJUST TO EIGHT PENCIL SIZES, 144 each 5290
HUNT-BOSTON $12.95 $5.45 $6.97 $6.99
5305 |SHEARS, 8", RIGHT AND LEFT HANDED, FISKARS, 288 each 5305
FKR2100 $495 | $164 | $0.69 $0.73 | $0.39
5320 |STAMP PADS, BLACK, FOAM RUBBER, MEDIUM SIZE, 72 each 5320
SANFORD S0.59 $1.43 $0.35 S0.50
5330 |JSTAMP PADS, RED, FOAM RUBBER, MEDIUM SIZE, 26 each 5330
SANFORD $0.59 $1.59 $0.35 $0.50
5340 |STAPLES, STANDARD, CHISEL POINT, 5000 PER BOX, 1200 box 5340
SWINGLINE $0.56 $1.05 $0.43 $0.39 $0.47 $0.39
5350 |STAPLERS, HAND GRIP, SMALL, METAL, SWINGLINE 144 each 5350
#99PL $4.45 $5.29 $3.54
5360 |STAPLERS, DESK SIZE, LARGE, METAL, SWINGLINE 288 each 5360
#74701 $8.12 $7.02 $6.69 $9.90 $10.88 $7.81
5370 |STAPLE REMOVERS, CLAW TYPE, A & W #1210 0 each 5370 $0.35 $0.23
5445 |STICKS, METER, WITH 39 1/4" SCALE ON REVERSE SIDE, 144 each 5445
WESTCOTT $1.29 $1.09 $3.99 $0.99 $0.84
5510 |TACKS, THUMB #2, 3/8", STEEL PLATED, 100 PER BOX 0 box 5510 $0.27 $0.50
5520 |TAPE, ADDING MACHINE, 2 1/4", WHITE BOND, SUB 16 144 roll 5520
$0.38 $0.35 $0.80 $0.34 $0.47
5580 |TAPE, CELLOPHANE, CLEAR PRESSURE, 1" CORE, 3/4" X 2400 roll 5580
1296", 3M#600 $0.69 $1.25 $0.54 $3.19 $1.93 $1.30
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5600 |JTAPE, DISPENSER WEIGHTED BASE, WILL DISPENSE 0 each 5600
1/2" OR 3/4" X1296", WITH 1" CORE, SCOTCH #38 $0.89 $0.81
5610 |TAPE, MAGIC MENDING, 3/4" X 1296", CLEAR 1224 roll 5610
PRESSURE, SENSITIVE, DISPENSES EASILY, 3M SCOTCH
#810 $0.81 $1.37 $0.68 $2.79 $2.15 $1.39
5615 |TAPE, MASKING, 3/4" WITH CREPE PAPER BACK, 400 roll 5615
ANCHOR $0.52 $0.51
5620 |TAPE, MASKING, 3/4", DOUBLE FACE, ANCHOR 0 roll 5620
$12.64
5655 |TAPE, GRAY DUCT, 2" X 60 YDS, ANCHOR 72 roll 5655
$2.55 $3.54 $2.53
8771 JCLEANER, LIQUID FOR DRY ERASER MARKER BOARDS, 8 144 bottle 8771
OZ. PUMP SPRAY BOTTLE $1.74 $2.27 $1.95 $0.95 $1.77 $2.28 $S0.95
16589 |POST-IT-NOTE PADS, 1 1/2" X 2", 12 PADS PER 144 pack 16589
PACKAGE, YELLOW, 3M $1.63 $1.04 $0.96 $5.43 $1.03 $0.96
16591 |JPOST-IT-NOTE PADS, 3" X 3", 12 PADS PER PACKAGE, 288 pack 16591
YELLOW, 3M $2.95 $2.48 $2.04 $7.76 $3.19 $2.03
16592 |JPOST-IT-NOTE PADS, 3" X 5", 12 PADS PER PACKAGE, 144 pack 16592
YELLOW, 3M $4.65 $3.24 $3.010 | $17.27 | $3.08 $3.00

Page 28 of 28



