LCS Bid	#5353-2016															
Custodi	al Supplies for the District Warehouse														SS	
Depart	Department: Warehouse														Ō	
	g: January 28, 2016												F		AD	
	Awarded by Item							۲,					DEPOT		AMBASSADORS	
	Local Preference Awarded (per Policy 6450)			Q				STAR			INTERBORO	NE	DEI	Q	lB∕	0
	Awarded by Tie Break (per Policy 6320)) t SBDO		0	0	Z		-	3B(INTERLINE	Ц Ц	PYRAMID	AN	& SBDO
	No Bid			AERO local &	e.	CALICO	САТКО	CLEAN	DADE	DASH	LE L	ΤE	OFFICE LOCAL	'RA	SMS	A al &
	Minimum Order Requirements Imposed			7	AFP			CLI						_		SPA local
ltem #	DESCRIPTION	QTY	UNIT	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price
8640	air freshener 16 oz. aerosol	144	can	\$2.50			\$2.08	\$1.75				\$3.73	\$3.25	\$2.09		\$1.97
8550	all purpose liquid cleaner, 5 gal size, aero do it all neutral lemon scent	36	5 gallon	\$19.90			\$33.90	\$17.00	\$23.96			\$32.93	\$58.86			\$19.77
8610	bleach, gal size liquid	504	gallon				\$1.48	\$1.75	\$1.35			\$1.41	\$3.17			\$1.47
8790	bottles, spray 32 oz. bottle w/pistol grip sprayer	144	each		\$0.69	\$0.89						\$1.06	\$0.53	\$0.74		\$0.80
8420	brooms, kitchen small, #18 lb broom corn filler 4 string band	72	each	\$4.99	\$3.86		\$4.90						\$5.89	\$4.26		\$4.00
8390	brooms, push 24' w/5 screwtype hndl mixed horsehair, durene border, T. plastic ctr	24	each	\$7.99	\$10.29	\$7.54	\$8.90						\$19.70	\$9.59		
8400	brooms, push 36' w/5 screwtype hndl mixed horsehair, durene border, T. plastic ctr	24	each	\$11.99	\$16.20		\$14.90						\$39.59	\$14.43		
8430	brooms, stick warehouse, large #36 lb broom corn filler 1 wire band 4 string bands	60	each	\$5.50	\$5.30		\$4.92						\$5.59	\$5.39		\$5.71
8510	buckets, 10 qt. plastic (polyethene) wire handle	24	each	\$3.25	\$3.61	\$3.18						\$3.77	\$9.99	\$3.19	\$4.75	
8202	balls, cotton non-sterile	25	case										\$15.19			
8230	bandages, adhesive 1x3	288	box									\$4.27	\$2.89			\$2.57
8291	facial tissue, white	1500	box	\$0.55			\$0.41	\$0.43				\$0.44	\$0.70	\$0.45		\$0.41
	furniture polish 18 oz aerosol	60	can	\$2.10			\$1.94	\$3.00	\$1.94			\$2.80	\$3.14	\$2.03		\$2.47
	germicidal / enz. 5/gal disinfectant, sant., fung., deodorizer cleaner, lemon quat	60	5 gallon	\$25.90			\$24.38	\$22.90					\$117.52			\$25.77
8840	glass cleaner gal size	72	gallon	\$2.99				\$2.70	\$2.60			\$4.95	\$7.49			\$4.37

LCS Bid	#5353-2016															
Custod	ial Supplies for the District Warehouse														S	
Depart	Department: Warehouse														OR	
Openin	g: January 28, 2016												L		AMBASSADORS	
	Awarded by Item							۲			0		рерот		SS	
	Local Preference Awarded (per Policy 6450)			Q				STAR			DRG	Ψ	DEF	D	ΒA	0
	Awarded by Tie Break (per Policy 6320)			SBDO		0	0	S Z			INTERBORO	INTERLINE		PYRAMID	MA	SBDO
	No Bid			AERO local &	۵	ΓIC	САТКО	CLEAN	DADE	DASH	LEA	LEF	FIC ⁴	RA	IS /	80
	Minimum Order Requirements Imposed			AERO local &	AFP	CALICO	CA	CL	DA	DA	Z	N	OFFICE LOCAL	PΥ	SMS	SPA local
	gloves, examination, non-latex, for clinic, powder free, 100 per box, medium	500	box	\$2.75	\$2.13	\$2.28		\$1.94	\$2.15	\$2.32	\$1.88	\$2.60	\$3.27	\$2.27	\$3.50	\$2.47
8293	gloves, examination, non-latex, for clinic, powder free, 100 per box, large	500	box	\$2.75	\$2.13	\$2.28	\$1.97	\$1.94	\$2.15	\$2.32	\$1.88	\$2.60	\$3.27	\$2.27	\$3.50	\$2.47
8294	gloves, examination, non-latex, for clinic, powder free, 100 per box, X-Large	500	box	\$2.75	\$2.13	\$2.28	\$1.97	\$1.94	\$2.15	\$2.32	\$1.88	\$2.60	\$3.59	\$2.27	\$3.50	\$2.47
8296	gloves, vinyl, elbow length, medium size utility glove	12	set		\$0.33								\$1.89	\$0.79		\$0.43
8770	hand soap liquid gallon size, germicidal	144	gallon	\$5.99				\$5.00				\$8.30	\$9.40	\$5.68		\$5.77
8775	hand soap, plain hand soap, non-germicidal, non-antibacterial, non-antiseptic	144	gallon	\$4.99				\$3.35	\$3.33			\$3.27	\$6.19			\$3.97
9340	handles, clamp type, wet mop quick change type, wing nut const. const. w/1 $^{1}/_{8}$ " dia x 54"	60	each	\$5.50		\$4.28	\$4.90					\$6.00	\$13.09	\$5.05		\$5.37
9360	handles, screw type for push broom 5' x $^{15}/_{16}$ " dia. w/3 die cast threaded aluminum tip	36	each	\$2.50	\$2.03		\$1.98					\$3.00	\$5.39	\$1.97		\$4.87
9180	lubricant spray 15oz can aerosol for nut, bolts, lock, etc.,	24	can	\$3.99			\$2.88	\$3.75				\$3.17	\$7.29	\$2.73		\$2.87
8845	mark remover 18 oz aerosol	24	can	\$3.99			\$2.92	\$4.25				\$4.39	\$6.72	\$3.22		\$2.73
8846	mold and mildew, eliminator, carpet sanitizer for extractors	10	case	\$49.90					\$46.40			\$44.00	\$18.13			\$25.00
9300	mop head, dust 18" refill white cotton yarn double stitch yarn 3 ½" trim 11" spread	24	each	\$2.99	\$1.46							\$3.21	\$11.39	\$2.79		\$3.17
9310	mop head, dust 24" refill white cotton yarn double stitch yarn 3 ½" trim 11" spread	24	each	\$3.25	\$1.86							\$3.28	\$9.24	\$3.23		\$3.77
9370	mop heads, rayon for waxing 24 oz 8 ply sliver white rayon yarn 1 ¼" band-4 sewn	144	each	\$2.99	\$5.41		\$2.75					\$2.46	\$7.75	\$3.71		\$4.75

LCS Bid	#5353-2016															
Custod	ial Supplies for the District Warehouse														S	
Depart	ment: Warehouse														OR	
Openin	g: January 28, 2016												L		AD	
	Awarded by Item							~			0		Б		SS	
	Local Preference Awarded (per Policy 6450)			0				STAR			DRC	٩	DEPOT	Δ	IBA	0
	Awarded by Tie Break (per Policy 6320)			s SBDO		0	ο	Z Z		_	INTERBORO	INTERLINE	Ц	PYRAMID	AMBASSADORS	SBDO
	No Bid			AERO local & .	e.	CALICO	САТКО	CLEAN	DADE	DASH	TEF	TEF	OFFICE LOCAL	RA	SMS	A al &
	Minimum Order Requirements Imposed			AE Ioc	AFP	CA	CA	С	DA	D¢	Ž	Z	D 1001	Рү	SN	SPA local
	mop heads, wet 24 oz 8 ply white cotton string yarn 1 ¼" bands - 4 sewn	144	each	\$2.99	\$3.01		\$2.19					\$2.22		\$2.89		\$3.87
	mop heads, wet 32 oz 8 ply white cotton string yarn 1 $4^{\prime\prime}$ bands -															
9390	4 sewn	72	each	\$3.99	\$4.04		\$3.24					\$3.45		\$3.69		\$4.97
9255	mops, toilet bowl, duralon yarn head w/acid proof plastic handle weight 1 lb	144	each	\$0.50	\$0.46	\$0.60						\$0.49	\$1.32	\$0.49		\$0.57
9350	mops, wet household 16 oz stick type 4 ply bleached white cotton yarn head tied w/48"	36	each	\$2.75	\$3.87							\$4.00	\$12.39	\$2.23		\$4.07
8670	multipurpose foam cleaner 19 oz aerosol, germicidal	1008	can	\$1.99				\$2.50	\$1.98			\$2.80	\$3.18	\$1.64		\$1.85
8245	napkins, sanitary	10	case				\$18.79	\$17.50	\$23.85			\$25.50	\$41.36	\$24.25		\$18.87
9510	pads, spray buffing 22" red 1" thick	0	each	\$3.50		\$3.33		\$5.00						\$3.23		\$3.65
9520	pads, spray buffing 23" red 1" thick	0	each	\$3.80		\$3.94		\$5.00						\$3.62		\$3.97
9560	pads, stripping 18" black 1" thick	25	each	\$2.00	\$1.71	\$2.07		\$3.00				\$2.08	\$6.98	\$1.98		\$2.30
9565	pads, stripping 19" black 1" thick	25	each	\$2.10	\$1.88	\$2.22		\$3.25	\$2.36			\$2.22	\$4.78	\$2.08		\$2.40
9570	pads, stripping 20" black 1" thick	25	each	\$2.25	\$2.06	\$2.40		\$3.25	\$2.55			\$2.66	\$5.18	\$2.23		\$2.75
9575	pads, stripping 21" black 1" thick	50	each	\$3.05	\$2.32	\$2.64		\$4.00				\$2.90		\$2.57		\$2.92
9580	pads, stripping 22"	25	each	\$3.50	\$2.59	\$3.27		\$5.00						\$3.19		\$3.19
9590	pads, stripping 23" black 1" thick	25	each	\$3.80	\$2.94	\$3.61		\$6.00						\$3.53		\$3.67
8253	paper, for cots, 21"	50	carton					\$37.50	\$33.84				\$53.04			
8720	rags, cleaning (non-cloth) WYPALL L30 12 packs of 90 / 1080 count total, NO ALTERNATES	50	case					\$36.00	\$31.30			\$42.00	\$66.49	\$39.50		\$36.00

Custod Depart Openin	#5353-2016 ial Supplies for the District Warehouse ment: Warehouse g: January 28, 2016 Awarded by Item Local Preference Awarded (per Policy 6450) Awarded by Tie Break (per Policy 6320) No Bid			AERO Iocal & SBDO	AFP	CALICO	САТКО	CLEAN STAR	DADE	DASH	INTERBORO	INTERLINE	OFFICE DEPOT LOCAL	PYRAMID	SMS AMBASSADORS	SPA local & SBDO
	Minimum Order Requirements Imposed				-			ฮ	Ď	D	Z	Z		_		•/
8815	sponges - abrasive bond onto cellulose 3.5" x 6.5"	200	each	\$0.55	\$0.75	\$0.53			\$0.60			\$0.79	\$3.48	\$0.54		\$0.60
8810	sponges - non-abrasive cellulose 2" x 4 ½ " x 7 ½"	200	each	\$1.50	\$2.52	\$1.20						\$1.71	\$0.55	\$1.35		
9665	spray, insecticide, aerosols can, residual (crawling insects)	288	can	\$3.99			\$2.48	\$3.25	\$3.29			\$2.33	\$5.99	\$2.76		\$2.35
9650	spray, insecticide wasp & hornet aerosols	288	can	\$3.99			\$2.75	\$3.05	\$3.40			\$2.33	\$8.39	\$2.92		\$2.35
8580	toilet bowl, cleaner 12 qt/cs, non-acid	50	case	\$19.50			\$14.19	\$13.70	\$22.95			\$13.70	\$17.88			\$14.45
	trash receptacle, <u>mobile barrel (with wheels)</u> 44 gal 24" dia, x 35 ⁷ / ₈ " w/o lid attached heavy plastic, RUBBERMAID "BRUTE" - NO ALTERNATES	24	each			\$46.11						\$49.95	\$86.29	\$46.79		
	trash receptacle, waste-basket classroom size large, rectangular 14 ½" x 10 ½" x 15 high, grey	144	each			\$3.24		\$3.05				\$4.40	\$3.61	\$3.09		
	trash receptacle, barrel 32 gal 22" dia x 27 ¼" w/o lid, grey, RUBBERMAID - NO ALTERNATES	12	each			\$21.74		\$35.00				\$27.72	\$38.15	\$19.92		
	trash receptacle square 23 gal w/swing top lid base 14 x 28" color grey, top 7" high, RUBBERMAID - NO ALTERNATES	24	each			\$47.87						\$49.95	\$73.49	\$44.76		
	Vo-trol (vomiting odor) 12 oz absorbs moisture, eliminating odors, oil and grease	72	each	\$4.25			\$4.88		\$3.30			\$5.35	\$8.59	\$4.65		
8837	wax remover 5 gal can spartan, shineline emulsifier plus	0	5 gallon				\$44.50	\$31.50				\$24.60	\$107.51			\$32.00
10267	wax, floor-liquid 5/gal can floor finish	60	5 gallon	\$42.90			\$39.90	\$35.00				\$49.68	\$68.16			\$41.00